Intertek Testing Services

September 23, 1999

Federal Communications Commission

c¢/o Mellon Bank Center

Three Mellon Bank Center

525 William Penn Way, 27th Fl., Rm. 153-2713
Pittsburgh, PA 15259-0001

Attention: Wholesale Lockbox Supervisor

Reference: FCC Part 15 Certification Application for GVC Corporation
FCC ID: DK4CT910
Confirmation # EA94887

Dear Sir/Madam:

“Enclosed please find the check of $940.00 as the filing fee for the above
referenced application.

Should you have any questions, please feel free to contact me at (650) 463-
2914 or email me at glim@itsqs.com

Thanks & regards,

éaspara Lim
gcl/

Enclosures: Check & FCC Form 159

Intertek Testing Services NA Inc.
1365 Adams Court, Menlo Park, CA 94025
Telephone 650-463-2000 Fax 650-463-2010 Home Page www.worldlab.com



A printable copy of your application follows. To print a copy of this form use the "Print' selection within the 'File’
menu of your web browser.

Approved by OMB
FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION 3060-0589
FCC 159, FCC REMITTANCE ADVICE : Expires 8/31/97
PAYOR INFORMATION
wm Did you have a number prior to this? Eater it. T. [0 AID lars and cents)
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14F, 76 Tun-Hwa S. Rd, Sec. 2
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886 3 328-7799 aiwan
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4F, 76 Tun-Hwa S. Rd, Sec. 2 Taipei, Taiwan
o MASTERCARIVVISA ACCOUNT NUMBER: mmnig
= = ol —
25 AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: romws]
DATE;
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Gaspara Lim ITS/ES-Mpk

From: CK Li ITS/QS-Mpk

Sent: Wednesday, September 01, 1999 4:38 PM
To: Gaspara Lim ITS/ES-Mpk

Subject: FW: Fee Payment

----QOriginal Message-----

From: oetech@fccsun07w.fcc.gov [mailto;oetech@fccsunl7w.fcc.govl <mailto:

[mailto:oetech@fccsun07w.fcc.gov]>
Sent: Wednesday, September 01, 1999 2:06 PM

To: CK Li ITS/QS-Mpk
Subject: Fee Payment
To: C.K. Li, null
From: Bette Taube
btaube@fcc.gov
FCC Application Processing Branch
Re: FCC ID DK4CT910
Applicant: GVC Corporation
Correspondence Reference Number: 9356
731 Confirmation Number: EA94887
Date of Original E-Mail: 08/24/1999

| am atlempting to verify fee payment of $940.00 for this application. Please provide evidence of payment as soon as
possible.

The items indicated above must be submitted before processing can continue on the above referenced application.
Failure to provide the requested information within 80 days of the original e-mail date may result in application dismissal
pursuant to Section 2.917 © and forfeiture of the filing fee pursuant to section 1.1108.

DO NOT reply to this e-mail by using the Reply button. In order for your response to be processed expeditiously, you
must upload your response via the Intemet at www.fcc.gov, Electronic Filing, OET Equipment Authorization Electronic
Filing. if the response is submitted through Add Attachments, a message which informs the processing staff that a new
exhibit has been submitted must also be submitted via Submit Correspondence. Also, please note that partial responses
increase processing time and should not be submitted.

Any questions about the content of this correspondence should be directed to the e-mail address listed below the name
of the sender.



