From: Mitchell Janklow

To: Behnam Ghaffari
Date: May 30, 2014

Subject: FCC File No. 0468-EX-ST-2014

Message:

| spoke with and email with Cores Cores@fcc.gov to clear up the problem.
Last 2 emails below.

Also, submitted &quot;Attachments&quot; a PDF with the approved of the AFTRCC coordination for the
July 4th event in Boston.

If you need any more information please do not hesitate to contact me.
Thank you for your help,

Mitchell Janklow

973-769-5998

mjanklow@verizon.net

?From: Cores Cores@fcc.gov

Subject: RE: FCC File No. 0468-EX-ST-2014
Date: May 28, 2014 at 10:19 AM

To: Mitch Janklow mjanklow@verizon.net

The account is now green which should enable the licensing bureau to proceed with processing the
application.

Stephen M. French
OMD-Financial Operations
Office: 1-B512

Direct Line: 202-418-1878
Fax: 202-418-7869

From: Mitch Janklow [mailto:mjanklow@verizon.net] Sent: Tuesday, May 27, 2014 9:50 PM
To: Cores
Subject: Re: FCC File No. 0468-EX-ST-2014

| spoke with Mike Sandorse of Remote Facilities Services Inc. Mike took care of this hill today that had
the Red Status.
Hopefully we can move ahead with this application.

Payment Info:

Your payment has been submitted to Pay.gov and the details are below. If you have any questions or you
wish to cancel this payment, please contact FCC Financial Operations

Group Help Desk at ARINQUIRIES@fcc.gov at 877-480-3201 option 4.

Application Name: Remittance Advice Pay.gov Tracking ID: 25FU2EIP Agency Tracking ID:
PGC2512106 Transaction Type: Sale

Transaction Date: May 27, 2014 5:58:42 PM

Account Holder Name: Remote Facilities consulting Services, Inc. Transaction Amount: $4.78
Billing Address: 9 Foster St., North Bay Place

City: Wakefield

State/Province: MA Zip/Postal Code: 01880 Country: USA



Thank You For Your Help,

Mitch

Mitch Janklow

Boston Fourth of July 2014

Remote Facilities Consulting Services Inc. cell: 973-769-5998
mjanklow@verizon.net



