
From: Danny Reichert dannyreichert8@gmail.com
Subject: Fwd: Payment Receipt Cherry Blue Filming from Aerospace & Flight Test Coordinating Council Inc

Date: August 15, 2017 at 11:24 AM
To: Barrett Donner barrettdonner@me.com, gregjohnson7@me.com

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Chriss Brown" <accountant@aftrcc.org>
Subject: Payment Receipt Cherry Blue Filming from Aerospace & Flight Test Coordinating Council Inc
Date: August 15, 2017 at 11=20=57 AM EDT
To: "'Danny Reichert'" <dannyreichert8@gmail.com>
Cc: 

Hi	Danny:	

Your	payment	receipt	for	the	requested	coordina7on(s)	for	640.00	is	a>ached.	
Your	coordina7on	will	be	forwarded	to	the	coordinator	for	processing.	

Thanks,	

Chriss	Brown,	CPA	
AFTRCC	Accountant	
316-821-9516




